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Proposed Policy – Job Reporting 
Policy Manual Version 2.0 

Submitted by Chris Neme, NRDC 

Policy Issue 

Describe the policy / issue to be discussed. Why does this policy require inclusion in 
the Policy Manual Version 2.0? What unresolved policy issue(s) will be resolved by 
inclusion in the Policy Manual Version 2.0? 
 
Utilities do not currently report on jobs created, but should given that jobs was one of 
the key objectives of FEJA.   

Proposed 
Resolution 

Describe the proposed resolution for this policy / issue, including any next steps that 
may be necessary. 
 
Note: After this policy issue is discussed at the Policy Manual Subcommittee, you 
may be assigned to draft proposed policy language for review by the Subcommittee. 
 
Utilities should estimate and report on jobs created through their efficiency 
programs.  The reports should be annual, at the portfolio level, and account for 
direct, indirect and induced jobs created.  The estimates should be provided by the 
utilities evaluators based on a common statewide method agreed to by the utilities’ 
evaluators with input from the SAG. 
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Market Impact 
Describe who this policy / issue impacts. Does this policy impact all Illinois utilities? 
 
It affects all IL utilities.   

Commission 
Directive(s) – if 
applicable 

Has the Illinois Commerce Commission previously addressed this policy or issue? If 
so, please provide language and specific citations, including the ICC docket number. 
 
Not to my knowledge. 

Statutory 
Consistency 

Have you reviewed your proposed policy against applicable Illinois statutes? Are 
there any possible conflicts? If so, please provide a citation and explanation. 
 
I see no conflicts.  While it is not a statutory requirement, it is inherently very 
consistent with the legislative intent. 

Background 
Research 
(optional) 

Provide any background research completed in preparing this template, including 
source references and links, as applicable. How do other jurisdictions address this 
policy issue? Has ACEEE, NASEO, MEEA or any other national or regional energy 
efficiency organization addressed this topic? If so, please provide reports and any 
other relevant sources. 
 
Have not done this research. 

Additional 
Information 

Provide additional information, as needed, to assist with understanding the issue 
and your request to include it in the Policy Manual Version 2.0. 
 
ComEd and Ameren have committed to working on a joint methodology for 
estimating jobs and reporting on them starting with the 2018 program year.  See 
Navigant docs on this issue. 

 
 


